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 Sloping ramp with logs Ht: 1.37m
The sloping ramp is an entry point that requires both balance and coordination by children.
The foot and hand holds, made of extra-thick larch, are positioned relatively high, making a
first foothold quite difficult. Children must therefore demonstrate their motor skills. The
angle of the slope helps make the climbing action easier. The height to be climbed (1.37m)
will thrill the most intrepid climbers.

sliding

 

 Slide Ht: 1.37m
The slide offers that most sought after experience in play areas: sliding from height. The
grip bar at the top of the slide is there to help avoid unintentional starts and to assist with
correct pre-slide positioning. The all stainless steel one-piece design of this slide makes it
wear-free. Height 1.37m: the minimum height for a breathtaking experience.
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 Vertical ladder Ht: 1.17
The vertical ladder gives direct access to the medium height platform. It is positioned at
right angles to the platform for easy ladder-platform transfer, possibly assisted using the
knees. The robinia wood rungs provide strong support for the feet. Controlling hand-hold
will prove a real challenge for children.



climbing

 

 Vertical net
The vertical net can be used for moving between two platforms. Fairly low, with a square,
regular mesh, this net is relatively easy to cross. On the net, children learn how to use
footholds and handholds in a coordinated way and progressively improve their
management of the sensations of height, empty space and imbalance.

meeting / role play

 

 Roof
Firmly anchored to robinia wood posts, this triangular roof is made of larch half-logs which
add volume to the play structure. The geometric shape also gives it a contemporary look.
Its primary function is to offer protection against rain and sun.

 

 Platform Ht: 1.37m
A triangular-shaped tower enables optimal distribution of play activities. The height of
1.37m is a significant height for more seasoned climbers with off-ground access points and
exits. The robinia wood posts are exceptionally resistant. The floor is made of anti-slip
compact for maximum safety.


